KANE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
BID #15-018 KC Lawn Maintenance Service
February 8, 2018 @ 10:30 AM

BID TABULATION:

LOC#1 | LOC#2 | LOC#3 | LOC#4 | LOC#5 | LOC#6 | LOCH7 | LOC#8 | LOC#9 | LOC#10 | LOC#11 | LOC#12 | LOC#13 | LOC#14 | LOC#15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTHDEPT | CRTSRVCS | GOVT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| skeripe | HLTH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
gip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VAC LOT) AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART1 | S 17000 | S 496.00 | S 20400 | S 15000 | S 46.00| S 46.00| S 250.00| S 130.00| S 400.00 | S 480.00 | & 55.00|S 150.00 S 5000|S 5000 |%2677.00 32 S 85,664.00
PART2A | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|% 1000|$ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART2B | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|$ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART2C | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
PART2D | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 1 S 400.00
ACRES GROUP PART2E | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
53940 W. Andrew PART3 | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500]|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
o « | , [PARTA__[$ 5000[$ 10000[S 5000]$ 50.00]$ 25005 2500]% 100.00|$ 50.00 $ 1500 |S 5000|% 51500 2 S 1,030.00
o PART5 | S 8500 % 24800|S 102.00|S 7500|% 2500|% 2500|% 12500|% 65.00 $ 2500|S 5000|% 82500 1 S 825.00
Plainfield, IL 60585 PART6B | S 354.00 | $1,054.00 | S 45000 | S 30000 | S 7500|S 7500|S 55000|S 23000 $  3500|S 100.00|$3,223.00 3 S 9,669.00
630.975.1426 PART6C |5 5000|9% 10000|% 5000|S 5000|% 2500|9% 2500]3% 5000|% 50.00 $ 1500 |5 2500 |% 440.00 1 3 440.00
PART6D | S 5000|$ 100.00|S 5000|S 5000|S 2500|% 2500|S 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 440.00 1 S 440.00
PART6E | S 5000 % 100.00|S 5000|S 5000|S 2500|% 2500|S 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 440.00 1 S 440.00
PART 7 $ 5000 $ 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 190.00 1 S 190.00
PART 8 $ 275.00 S 275.00 1 3 275.00
ALT #1 $  62.00 S 6200| 500 |5 31,000.00|% 101,773.00
PART1 | S 240013 46964 ]S 11532|S 162205 5580]% 91.98]% 20158 |S 66093 76062 |S1,079.40 |S 48159 | $2,409.94 S 39055 150.74 | 56,323.96 32 S 202,366.72
PART2A |S 272|% 816|S 3264|S ©544|S 3114|S 1088|S 1632|S 544 S  816|5 3536|35 15626 6 3 937.56
PART2B |S 35363 4080|S 3264|S 5443 544|S 1632|S 1632|S 544 $ 1088 |S 3536|% 204.00 6 S 1,224.00
PART2C | S 14233 |$1,003.23 | S 20144 |S 27259 |S 5144 |S 11858 |% 31987 |S 16603 NoBid |S 453.76 | $2,729.27 4 S 10,917.08
CORNERSTONE PART 2D No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ - 4 s -
PARTNERS PART 2E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ - 4 3 -
HORTICULTURAL PART3 |S 21083 39060|S 1271|S 12354 S 1042|% 9.18|% 16889 |S 1141 $ 9233|S 1274|S 85290 4 S 3,411.60
SERVICES « | | [PARTA_|S 128855159649 S 195095 809.16|5 3808[$ 53375 616845 109.10 S 41433 | $ 297.88 | $4,259.19 2 S 851838
P.O. Box 745 PART5 | $1,30001 | 3568698 | S 887.87 | $1,780.53 | S 23355 | 41897 | $2,072.91 |S 367.47 S 29968 | $ 502.07 |5 1355004 1 S 13,550.04
st. Charles, IL PART6B | 51,42063 | $3,63652 | 5 541.99 | $1,079.19 | $ 21633 | 5 40449 | $1,26516 |5 305.40 S 153.99 [ § 47951 | $9,503.21 3 S 28,509.63
60174 PART6C | 51,482.87 | $3,79853 | 5 562.22 | $1,124.45 | § 13353 |5 291.65|$1,321.23 |6 22138 S 3514 |6 347.88|59,318.88 1 S 0,318.88
630.482.9950 PART6D |S 31885 53424 |5 5249|S 20360 |5 5249|%5 5502|9% 23890|S 5249 $ 14424 |S 5592 |S$1,422.17 1 S 1,422.17
PARTGE | S 153.78 | S 648.71|S 143.25|S 34060 |$ 10455|S 10455|S 34747 ]S 116.11 $ 12285 S 12285 | $2,204.72 1 S 2,04.72
PART 7 $ 413.58 S 117515 358.06 S 38582 |6 433.13 | $1,708.10 1 S 1,708.10
PART 8 $5,709.95 $5,709.95 1 S 5,709.95
ALT #1 S 6482 S 64.82 500 | S 32,410.00 | S 289,798.83
PARTL |S 70005 17500]% 6200]S 7000|% 3000]% 4500]9% 132.00|S 40003 41500|S 35000 % 600.00|3% 850.00 S 30005 35.00]5%2,904.00 32 S 92,928.00
PART2A |S 20005 5000|% 1800|S 2000|% 1000|% 13.00|S 3750|% 12.00 S 1000 |% 10.00|3% 20050 6 S 1,203.00
PART2B | S 20005 5000|% 1800|S 2000|% 1000|% 1300|S 3750|% 12.00 S 1000 |% 10.00|% 20050 6 S 1,203.00
PART2C |S 17000 |% 42500|% 14800|S 17000|% 7500|% 10500|S 31800 95.00 S 68005 80.00]|51,654.00 4 S 6,616.00
PART2D |S 15000[% 375.00|9% 130.00|S 15000 % 6500|% 94.00|S 28000 84.00 S 6000 |S 70.00|$1,458.00 4 S 5832.00
COUNTY WIDE PART2E | S 12000 [% 300.00|% 10500|S 12000|% 5500|% 7500|S 22500 68.00 S 4800 |S 5800]51,174.00 4 S 4,696.00
LANDSCAPE PART3 |S 75005 190.00|% 67.00|S 7500|% 3400|% 4800|S 14000 S 4500 S 3000|% 3600|% 740.00 4 S 2,960.00
sowsot eitnrd | x | no [PARTA [ 200.00 [$ 50500 |$ 178.00 | 20500 |$ 9000 [$ 12600 |$ 380.00 |5 11500 S 8000 |S 95.00]5%1,974.00 2 S 3,948.00
PART5 | S 20000[% 50500|% 178.00|S 20500|% 90.00|% 126.00|S 380.00|% 115.00 S 8000 |S 95.00]5%1,974.00 1 S 1,974.00
Elburn, IL 60199 PART6B | S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S$ 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 3 S 5865.00
630.659.6231 PART6C | S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000 % 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART6D |S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART6E | S 200.00|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART 7 $ 425.00 $ 70000 | 300.00 S 8000 250.00|3%1,755.00 1 S 1,755.00
PART 8 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 1 S 1,050.00
ALT #1 S 70.00 S 7000| 500 |$ 35000005 135895.00

PLEASE NOTE:
- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13




LOC#1 LOC #2 LOC #3 LOC #4 LOC #5 LOC #6 LOC #7 LOC #8 LOC #9 LOC #10 LOC#11 LOC #12 LOC #13 LOC #14 LOC #15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTH DEPT | CRTSRVCS | GovT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| sweripe | HETH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
pip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VACLOT) | AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART 1 S 100.00 |$ 185.00 (S 165.00| S 60.00 | $ 30.00 | $§ 30.00 | $ 260.00 | S 30.00|$ 150.00|S 175.00|$ 30.00 | $ 150.00 S 30.00 | $§ 40.00 | $1,435.00 32 S 45,920.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 (S 5.00 (S 30.00 | $§ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 [ $ 110.00 6 S 660.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 30.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ $ 110.00 6 S 660.00
PART 2C S 10.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 5.00 (S 5.00 (S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 15.00 | $ 40.00 | S 225.00 4 S 900.00
PART 2D S 60.00 | $ 40.00 | S 60.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 5.00 | S 125.00 |$ 370.00 4 S 1,480.00
TWIN OAKS PART 2E S 15.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | S 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5.00 (S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 40.00 | S 220.00 4 S 880.00
LANDSCAPING PART 3 S 150.00 | S 100.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 20.00 | $ 140.00 | S 45.00 S 30.00 | $ 207.00 (S 827.00 4 S 3,308.00
997 Harvey X 1 PART 4 S 75.00 | $ 165.00 | S 140.00 | $ 140.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 20.00 | $ 135.00 (S 75.00 S 65.00 | $ 140.00 [ S 975.00 2 S 1,950.00
Oswego, IL 60543 PART 5 S 100.00 | S 200.00 [$ 220.00|S 160.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | $ 320.00 | S 45.00 S 75.00 | $ 260.00 | $1,460.00 1 S 1,460.00
’ PART 6B S 437.00|S 660.00 S 720.00|S 380.00 S 60.00 | § 60.00 | $ 690.00 [ S 140.00 S 45.00 [ S 180.00 | $3,372.00 3 S 10,116.00
630.554.3399

PART 6C S 150.00 | S 705.00 S 830.00|S 500.00|S$ 60.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 605.00 | S 65.00 S 75.00 | $ 115.00 | $3,125.00 1 S 3,125.00
PART 6D S 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 20.00 S 45.00 | S 90.00 | $ 590.00 1 S 590.00
PART 6E S 50.00 | $ 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 80.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | S 40.00 | S 410.00 1 S 410.00
PART 7 S 160.00 S 160.00 | $ 120.00 S 35.00 | $ 215.00 [ S 690.00 1 S 690.00
PART 8 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 1 S 1,700.00
ALT #1 S 45.00 S 45.00 500 S 22,500.00 | $ 73,849.00
PART 1 S 88.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 23.00 | $§ 41.00 | S 52.00 | $§ 21.00 | S 300.00 S 900.00|S 40.00 | S 400.00 S 23.00 | $§ 50.00 | $2,638.00 32 S  84,416.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 2150 | $ 1450 | S 10.50 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ S 126.50 6 S 759.00
PART2B |$ 1000|$ 2150|% 1450|% 1050|% 1000|$ 1000|$ 2000|% 10.00 $ 1000 |$ 10.00|$ 12650 6 $ 759.00
PART 2C S 5.00 | S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 10.50 | S 12.00 | S 15.00 | S 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 15.00 | S 10.00 [ $ 210.50 4 S 842.00
WA PART 2D S 5.00|S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 1050 | $ 12.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 [ $ 205.50 4 S 822.00
MANAGEMENT, PART 2E S 5.00 | S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 26.00 | $§ 12.00 | S 15.00 | S 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 15.00 | S 10.00 [ S 226.00 4 S 904.00
INC PART 3 S 5.00|S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 1050 | $ 12.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 [ $ 215.50 4 S 862.00
P.O. Box 844 X 1 PART 4 S 10.00 [ S 127.00 | S 32.00 | $ 10.50 | S 10.00 | S 15.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 S 12.00 | S 30.00 | $ 306.50 2 S 613.00
West Chicago, IL PART 5 S 13.00 [ $ 600.00 | S 58.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 45.00 | S 215.00 | $ 60.00 S 200.00 [ $ 300.00 | $1,613.00 1 S 1,613.00
60186 PART 6B S 100.00 | S 870.00 (S 211.00|S 260.00|S 45.00 | S 50.00 | $ 250.00 | S 50.00 S 100.00 | $ 350.00 [ $2,286.00 3 S 6,858.00
630.876.0860 PART 6C S 300.00 | $2,200.00 [ S 684.00|S 260.00|S 45.00 | S 50.00 [ $ 500.00 (S 25.00 S 150.00 | $ 400.00 | $4,614.00 1 S 4,614.00
PART 6D S 15.00 [ S 420.00 | S 48.00 | S 43.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 30.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 15.00 S 20.00 | $ 50.00 | § 706.00 1 S 706.00
PART 6E S 15.00 | S 470.00 | S 96.00 | $ 78.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 95.00 | S 20.00 S 30.00 S 60.00 [ § 914.00 1 S 914.00
PART 7 S 78.00 S 76.00 | $ 70.00 S 48.00 | S 90.00 | $ 362.00 1 S 362.00
PART 8 S 800.00 S 800.00 1 S 800.00
ALT #1 S 38.00 S 38.00 500 S 19,000.00 | $ 105,844.00
PART 1 S 350.00|S 630.00 S 140.00|S 140.00|S 70.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 350.00 (S 175.00|$1,500.00 S 750.00|S 75.00 | $1,500.00 S 15.00 | $ 85.00 | $5,850.00 32 S 187,200.00
PART 2A S 18.00 | S 70.00 | $ 18.00 | S 18.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 20.00 S 15.00 | S 20.00 [ § 279.00 6 S 1,674.00
PART 2B S 35.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 18.00 | S 18.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 70.00 | $§ 20.00 S 15.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 296.00 6 S 1,776.00
PART 2C S 280.00 (S 280.00(S 140.00|S 105.00|S 20.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 210.00(S 35.00 No Bid S 70.00 | $1,160.00 4 S 4,640.00
PART 2D S 140.00 | S 280.00 (S 140.00|S 105.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $ 210.00 | S 20.00 No Bid S 70.00 | § 995.00 4 S 3,980.00
WINTERS PART 2E S 70.00 | $ 560.00 S 140.00(S$S 105.00(S 10.00 | S 20.00 [ $ 210.00(S 20.00 No Bid S 70.00 | $1,205.00 4 S 4,820.00
LANDSCAPE PART 3 S 210.00 | S 280.00 (S 140.00|S 70.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 210.00 | S 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 70.00 | $1,105.00 4 S 4,420.00
50W410 Marcy Rd X NO PART 4 S 420.00 | $2,240.00 | S 140.00|S 280.00 | $ 70.00 [ $ 140.00 S 560.00 (S 140.00 S 35.00 | $ 140.00 | $4,165.00 2 S 8,330.00
Sycamore, IL 60178 PART 5 S 280.00|$1,120.00 | $ 280.00 [ S 280.00 | S 140.00|$ 140.00 |S 700.00 | S 280.00 S 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $3,500.00 1 S 3,500.00
847.72,1.1428 PART 6B S 825.00|51,410.00 (S 270.00|S 360.00 |$ 85.00 | S 85.00 | $ 675.00 | $ 330.00 S 45.00 | S 195.00 | $4,280.00 3 S 12,840.00
PART 6C S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 6D S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 (S 15.00 | S 15.00 | S 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 (S 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 6E S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 7 S 35.00 S 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 S 35.00 | § 245.00 1 S 245.00

PART 8 No Bid S - 1 S -
ALT #1 S 55.00 S 55.00 500 S 27,500.00 | S 234,850.00

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13




LOC#1 LOC #2 LOC #3 LOC #4 LOC #5 LOC #6 LOC #7 LOC #8 LOC #9 LOC #10 LOC#11 LOC #12 LOC #13 LOC #14 LOC #15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTH DEPT | CRTSRVCS | GovT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| sweripe | HETH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
pip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VACLOT) | AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART 1 S 600.00|S 560.00 S 155.00|S 218.00 ]S 70.00 | $§ 75.00 | $ 435.00 (S 90.00 | $1,500.00 [ S 500.00 | $ 150.00 | $1,000.00 S 90.00 [ S 750.00 | $6,193.00 32 S 198,176.00
PART 2A S 50.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 75.00 | $ 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 175.00 [ S 455.00 6 S 2,730.00
PART 2B S 50.00 | $ 25.00 | $§ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 75.00 | § 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 125.00 [ S 405.00 6 S 2,430.00
PART 2C S 140.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 100.00 | $ 120.00 (S 712.00 4 S 2,848.00
CHRISTY WEBBER PART 2D S 140.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 75.00 | $ 120.00 [ S 687.00 4 S 2,748.00
LANDSCAPES PART 2E S 100.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 100.00 | $ 120.00 [ S 672.00 4 S 2,688.00
2900West PART 3 S 125.00|S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 12.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 200.00|S$ 120.00 (S 807.00 4 S 3,228.00
Ferdinand St X 1 PART 4 S 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 50.00 | $ 150.00 | S 35.00 S 100.00 | $ 420.00 [ $1,175.00 2 S 2,350.00
Chicago, IL 60612 PART 5 $1,820.00 | $ 600.00|S$ 225.00 S 250.00|S$ 100.00|$ 115.00 S 900.00 | S 230.00 S 250.00 | $1,800.00 | $6,290.00 1 S 6,290.00
773.533.0477 PART 6B $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 | $ 400.00 | S 350.00 | $ 80.00 | § 150.00 | $1,800.00 [ S 400.00 S 400.00 | $1,500.00 | $7,580.00 3 S 22,740.00
PART 6C $2,500.00 | $2,600.00 | $1,000.00 [ S 350.00 | $ 80.00 | S 50.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 50.00 S 50.00 | $2,600.00 | $9,880.00 1 S 9,880.00
PART 6D S 475.00|S$ 450.00 (S 100.00|S 150.00 | $ 15.00 | S 25.00 | $ 200.00 | S 50.00 S 70.00 | § 500.00 | $2,035.00 1 S 2,035.00
PART 6E S 500.00|S 500.00(S$ 125.00|S 100.00 |S 50.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 50.00 S 50.00 | $ 400.00 | $1,965.00 1 S 1,965.00
PART 7 $1,150.00 S 150.00 | $ 950.00 S 800.00 | $1,500.00 | $4,550.00 1 S 4,550.00
PART 8 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 1 S 1,500.00
ALT #1 S 60.00 S 60.00 500 S 30,000.00 | S 266,158.00
PART 1 S 190.00 | S 490.00 [ S 200.00|S 110.00|S 40.00 | S 45.00 | $ 310.00 | S 90.00 | $1,100.00 [ $ 190.00 | S 80.00 | $1,400.00 S 75.00 | § 60.00 | $4,380.00 32 S 140,160.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5.00|S 5.00 (S 10.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ S 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART 2C S 50.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 40.00 | S 10.00 S 30.00 | $§ 25.00 | $ 350.00 4 S 1,400.00
PART 2D S 40.00 | $ 180.00 | S 50.00 | $ 40.00 | S 15.00 | S 25.00 | $§ 15.00 | S 40.00 S 15.00 | S 25.00 | S$ 445.00 4 S 1,780.00
SEBERT LANDSCAPE PART 2E S 20.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | 20.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 | $§ 15.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 265.00 4 S 1,060.00
30W741 Butterfiled PART 3 S 100.00 | S 600.00 S 200.00|S 220.00 ]S 45.00 | S 60.00 | $ 400.00 | S 30.00 S 50.00 | $ 90.00 | $1,795.00 4 S 7,180.00
Rd X 1 PART 4 $ 150.00 | S 600.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 50.00 | § 40.00 | S 500.00 | $ 45.00 S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $1,805.00 2 S 3,610.00
Naperville, IL PART 5 S 200.00|S 850.00 S 350.00|S 400.00|$ 20000 (S 250.00|S 650.00 S 175.00 S 150.00 | $ 180.00 | $3,405.00 1 S 3,405.00
630.236.9?:50 PART 6B S 250.00 | $1,300.00 | $ 250.00 [ S 380.00 |$ 100.00|S$ 200.00 S 650.00 S 500.00 S 100.00 [ $ 150.00 | $3,880.00 3 S 11,640.00
PART 6C S 250.00 | $1,300.00 [ S 400.00 | S 380.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 700.00 [ S 350.00 S 80.00 | S 100.00 | $3,800.00 1 S 3,800.00
PART 6D S 100.00 | $ 300.00|S$ 250.00S 100.00|S 70.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 150.00 | S 40.00 S 60.00 | $ 90.00 | $1,240.00 1 S 1,240.00
PART 6E S 50.00 | $ 280.00 | S 50.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 200.00 | S 30.00 S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | § 765.00 1 S 765.00
PART 7 S 400.00 S 65.00 [ $ 300.00 S 100.00 | S 100.00 | S 965.00 1 S 965.00
PART 8 $ 3,500.00 $ 3,500.00 1 S 3,500.00
ALT #1 S 55.00 S 55.00 500 S 27,500.00 | $ 181,705.00
PART 1 S 128.00(S 160.00|S$ 100.00|S 110.00 (S 35.00 (S 55.00 | $ 295.00( S 75.00 [ $ 450.00 (S 400.00 | S 70.00 [ $ 400.00 S 70.00 | $ 145.00 | $2,493.00 32 S 79,776.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 45.00 | S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.00 | S 5.00 | $ 100.00 | $§ 5.00 S 5.00 | S 45.00 | S 260.00 6 S 1,560.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 75.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.001|S 500|S$ 195.00 1S 5.00 S 5.00 ]S 30.00 [ § 370.00 6 S 2,220.00
PART 2C S 150.00 | $ 200.00 [ S 150.00 |S 250.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 425.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 310.00 | $1,575.00 4 S 6,300.00
PART 2D S 150.00 (S 200.00 S 150.00|S 175.00 (S 20.00 | $ 4500 | S 120.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 180.00 | $1,065.00 4 S 4,260.00
LOCAL LAWN CARE PART 2E S 150.00 | S 200.00 (S 175.00| S 250.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 420.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 180.00 | $1,465.00 4 S 5,860.00
& LANDSCAPING PART 3 S 175.00 S 200.00 (S 475.00|S 175.00|S 100.00 (S 165.00|S 610.00| S 40.00 S 290.00 | $ 149.00 | $2,379.00 4 S 9,516.00
105112 Schoger Dr X 1 PART 4 S 370.00|S 495.00|S 320.00|S 610.00|S 31000 (S 390.00|S 855.00|S 60.00 S 385.00 [ $ 310.00 | $4,105.00 2 S 8,210.00
Naperville, IL PART 5 S 320.00 (S 400.00|S 200.00(S 320.00]|S 75.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 690.00 | S 75.00 S 195.00 | $ 160.00 | $2,510.00 1 S 2,510.00
60564 PART 6B S 575.00|S 900.00 [ S 410.00|S 495.00 | $ 90.00 | S 145.00 | S 880.00 (S 185.00 S 60.00 | $ 265.00 | $4,005.00 3 S 12,015.00
630.338.5793 PART 6C S 600.00|S 975.00 S 450.00|S 610.00|$ 12500 (S 165.00|51,110.00 | S 195.00 S 85.00 | S 295.00 | $4,610.00 1 S 4,610.00
PART 6D S 75.00 | $ 710.00 | S 75.00 | $ 310.00 | S 40.00 | S 65.00 | S 495.00 [ S 145.00 S 110.00 | $ 65.00 | $2,090.00 1 S 2,090.00
PART 6E S 145.00 S 620.00|S 275.00|S 300.00|S 60.00 | S 90.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 110.00 S 45.00 | S 280.00 | $2,420.00 1 S 2,420.00
PART 7 $1,850.00 S 590.00 | $2,368.00 $1,125.00 | $1,980.00 | $7,913.00 1 S 7,913.00
PART 8 $1,095.00 $1,095.00 1 S 1,095.00
ALT #1 $  75.00 S 75.00 500 $ 37,500.00 | $ 150,355.00

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13




KANE COUNTY GOVERNMENT
BID #15-018 KC Lawn Maintenance Service
February 8, 2018 @ 10:30 AM

BID TABULATION:

LOC#1 | LOC#2 | LOC#3 | LOC#4 | LOC#5 | LOC#6 | LOCH7 | LOC#8 | LOC#9 | LOC#10 | LOC#11 | LOC#12 | LOC#13 | LOC#14 | LOC#15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTHDEPT | CRTSRVCS | GOVT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| skeripe | HLTH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
gip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VAC LOT) AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART1 | S 17000 | S 496.00 | S 20400 | S 15000 | S 46.00| S 46.00| S 250.00| S 130.00| S 400.00 | S 480.00 | & 55.00|S 150.00 S 5000|S 5000 |%2677.00 32 S 85,664.00
PART2A | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|% 1000|$ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART2B | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|$ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART2C | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|% 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
PART2D | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 1 S 400.00
ACRES GROUP PART2E | S 1000|S 2000|S 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
53940 W. Andrew PART3 | S 1000|S 2000|S$ 1000|S 1000|S 500|S 500]|S 1500|% 10.00 $  500|S 1000|S 100.00 4 S 400.00
o « | , [PARTA__[$ 5000[$ 10000[S 5000]$ 50.00]$ 25005 2500]% 100.00|$ 50.00 $ 1500 |S 5000|% 51500 2 S 1,030.00
o PART5 | S 8500 % 24800|S 102.00|S 7500|% 2500|% 2500|% 12500|% 65.00 $ 2500|S 5000|% 82500 1 S 825.00
Plainfield, IL 60585 PART6B | S 354.00 | $1,054.00 | S 45000 | S 30000 | S 7500|S 7500|S 55000|S 23000 $  3500|S 100.00|$3,223.00 3 S 9,669.00
630.975.1426 PART6C |5 5000|9% 10000|% 5000|S 5000|% 2500|9% 2500]3% 5000|% 50.00 $ 1500 |5 2500 |% 440.00 1 3 440.00
PART6D | S 5000|$ 100.00|S 5000|S 5000|S 2500|% 2500|S 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 440.00 1 S 440.00
PART6E | S 5000 % 100.00|S 5000|S 5000|S 2500|% 2500|S 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 440.00 1 S 440.00
PART 7 $ 5000 $ 5000|% 5000 $ 1500 |S 25.00|% 190.00 1 S 190.00
PART 8 $ 275.00 S 275.00 1 3 275.00
ALT #1 $  62.00 S 6200| 500 |5 31,000.00|% 101,773.00
PART1 | S 240013 46964 ]S 11532|S 162205 5580]% 91.98]% 20158 |S 66093 76062 |S1,079.40 |S 48159 | $2,409.94 S 39055 150.74 | 56,323.96 32 S 202,366.72
PART2A |S 272|% 816|S 3264|S ©544|S 3114|S 1088|S 1632|S 544 S  816|5 3536|35 15626 6 3 937.56
PART2B |S 35363 4080|S 3264|S 5443 544|S 1632|S 1632|S 544 $ 1088 |S 3536|% 204.00 6 S 1,224.00
PART2C | S 14233 |$1,003.23 | S 20144 |S 27259 |S 5144 |S 11858 |% 31987 |S 16603 NoBid |S 453.76 | $2,729.27 4 S 10,917.08
CORNERSTONE PART 2D No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ - 4 s -
PARTNERS PART 2E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |$ - 4 3 -
HORTICULTURAL PART3 |S 21083 39060|S 1271|S 12354 S 1042|% 9.18|% 16889 |S 1141 $ 9233|S 1274|S 85290 4 S 3,411.60
SERVICES « | | [PARTA_|S 128855159649 S 195095 809.16|5 3808[$ 53375 616845 109.10 S 41433 | $ 297.88 | $4,259.19 2 S 851838
P.O. Box 745 PART5 | $1,30001 | 3568698 | S 887.87 | $1,780.53 | S 23355 | 41897 | $2,072.91 |S 367.47 S 29968 | $ 502.07 |5 1355004 1 S 13,550.04
st. Charles, IL PART6B | 51,42063 | $3,63652 | 5 541.99 | $1,079.19 | $ 21633 | 5 40449 | $1,26516 |5 305.40 S 153.99 [ § 47951 | $9,503.21 3 S 28,509.63
60174 PART6C | 51,482.87 | $3,79853 | 5 562.22 | $1,124.45 | § 13353 |5 291.65|$1,321.23 |6 22138 S 3514 |6 347.88|59,318.88 1 S 0,318.88
630.482.9950 PART6D |S 31885 53424 |5 5249|S 20360 |5 5249|%5 5502|9% 23890|S 5249 $ 14424 |S 5592 |S$1,422.17 1 S 1,422.17
PARTGE | S 153.78 | S 648.71|S 143.25|S 34060 |$ 10455|S 10455|S 34747 ]S 116.11 $ 12285 S 12285 | $2,204.72 1 S 2,04.72
PART 7 $ 413.58 S 117515 358.06 S 38582 |6 433.13 | $1,708.10 1 S 1,708.10
PART 8 $5,709.95 $5,709.95 1 S 5,709.95
ALT #1 S 6482 S 64.82 500 | S 32,410.00 | S 289,798.83
PARTL |S 70005 17500]% 6200]S 7000|% 3000]% 4500]9% 132.00|S 40003 41500|S 35000 % 600.00|3% 850.00 S 30005 35.00]5%2,904.00 32 S 92,928.00
PART2A |S 20005 5000|% 1800|S 2000|% 1000|% 13.00|S 3750|% 12.00 S 1000 |% 10.00|3% 20050 6 S 1,203.00
PART2B | S 20005 5000|% 1800|S 2000|% 1000|% 1300|S 3750|% 12.00 S 1000 |% 10.00|% 20050 6 S 1,203.00
PART2C |S 17000 |% 42500|% 14800|S 17000|% 7500|% 10500|S 31800 95.00 S 68005 80.00]|51,654.00 4 S 6,616.00
PART2D |S 15000[% 375.00|9% 130.00|S 15000 % 6500|% 94.00|S 28000 84.00 S 6000 |S 70.00|$1,458.00 4 S 5832.00
COUNTY WIDE PART2E | S 12000 [% 300.00|% 10500|S 12000|% 5500|% 7500|S 22500 68.00 S 4800 |S 5800]51,174.00 4 S 4,696.00
LANDSCAPE PART3 |S 75005 190.00|% 67.00|S 7500|% 3400|% 4800|S 14000 S 4500 S 3000|% 3600|% 740.00 4 S 2,960.00
sowsot eitnrd | x | no [PARTA [ 200.00 [$ 50500 |$ 178.00 | 20500 |$ 9000 [$ 12600 |$ 380.00 |5 11500 S 8000 |S 95.00]5%1,974.00 2 S 3,948.00
PART5 | S 20000[% 50500|% 178.00|S 20500|% 90.00|% 126.00|S 380.00|% 115.00 S 8000 |S 95.00]5%1,974.00 1 S 1,974.00
Elburn, IL 60199 PART6B | S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S$ 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 3 S 5865.00
630.659.6231 PART6C | S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000 % 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART6D |S 20000|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART6E | S 200.00|% 500.00|% 175.00|S 20000|% 90.00|% 12500|S 37500 % 115.00 S 8000|% 95.00]5%1,95500 1 S 1,955.00
PART 7 $ 425.00 $ 70000 | 300.00 S 8000 250.00|3%1,755.00 1 S 1,755.00
PART 8 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 1 S 1,050.00
ALT #1 S 70.00 S 7000| 500 |$ 35000005 135895.00

PLEASE NOTE:
- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13




LOC#1 LOC #2 LOC #3 LOC #4 LOC #5 LOC #6 LOC #7 LOC #8 LOC #9 LOC #10 LOC#11 LOC #12 LOC #13 LOC #14 LOC #15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTH DEPT | CRTSRVCS | GovT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| sweripe | HETH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
pip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VACLOT) | AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART 1 S 100.00 |$ 185.00 (S 165.00| S 60.00 | $ 30.00 | $§ 30.00 | $ 260.00 | S 30.00|$ 150.00|S 175.00|$ 30.00 | $ 150.00 S 30.00 | $§ 40.00 | $1,435.00 32 S 45,920.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 (S 5.00 (S 30.00 | $§ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 [ $ 110.00 6 S 660.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 30.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ $ 110.00 6 S 660.00
PART 2C S 10.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 5.00 (S 5.00 (S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 15.00 | $ 40.00 | S 225.00 4 S 900.00
PART 2D S 60.00 | $ 40.00 | S 60.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 5.00 | S 125.00 |$ 370.00 4 S 1,480.00
TWIN OAKS PART 2E S 15.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | S 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5.00 (S 40.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 40.00 | S 220.00 4 S 880.00
LANDSCAPING PART 3 S 150.00 | S 100.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 20.00 | $ 140.00 | S 45.00 S 30.00 | $ 207.00 (S 827.00 4 S 3,308.00
997 Harvey X 1 PART 4 S 75.00 | $ 165.00 | S 140.00 | $ 140.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 20.00 | $ 135.00 (S 75.00 S 65.00 | $ 140.00 [ S 975.00 2 S 1,950.00
Oswego, IL 60543 PART 5 S 100.00 | S 200.00 [$ 220.00|S 160.00 | S 40.00 | S 40.00 | $ 320.00 | S 45.00 S 75.00 | $ 260.00 | $1,460.00 1 S 1,460.00
’ PART 6B S 437.00|S 660.00 S 720.00|S 380.00 S 60.00 | § 60.00 | $ 690.00 [ S 140.00 S 45.00 [ S 180.00 | $3,372.00 3 S 10,116.00
630.554.3399

PART 6C S 150.00 | S 705.00 S 830.00|S 500.00|S$ 60.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 605.00 | S 65.00 S 75.00 | $ 115.00 | $3,125.00 1 S 3,125.00
PART 6D S 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 20.00 S 45.00 | S 90.00 | $ 590.00 1 S 590.00
PART 6E S 50.00 | $ 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 80.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | S 40.00 | S 410.00 1 S 410.00
PART 7 S 160.00 S 160.00 | $ 120.00 S 35.00 | $ 215.00 [ S 690.00 1 S 690.00
PART 8 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 1 S 1,700.00
ALT #1 S 45.00 S 45.00 500 S 22,500.00 | $ 73,849.00
PART 1 S 88.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 23.00 | $§ 41.00 | S 52.00 | $§ 21.00 | S 300.00 S 900.00|S 40.00 | S 400.00 S 23.00 | $§ 50.00 | $2,638.00 32 S  84,416.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 2150 | $ 1450 | S 10.50 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ S 126.50 6 S 759.00
PART2B |$ 1000|$ 2150|% 1450|% 1050|% 1000|$ 1000|$ 2000|% 10.00 $ 1000 |$ 10.00|$ 12650 6 $ 759.00
PART 2C S 5.00 | S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 10.50 | S 12.00 | S 15.00 | S 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 15.00 | S 10.00 [ $ 210.50 4 S 842.00
WA PART 2D S 5.00|S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 1050 | $ 12.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 [ $ 205.50 4 S 822.00
MANAGEMENT, PART 2E S 5.00 | S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 26.00 | $§ 12.00 | S 15.00 | S 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 15.00 | S 10.00 [ S 226.00 4 S 904.00
INC PART 3 S 5.00|S 90.00 | S 22.00 | $ 1050 | $ 12.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 10.00 S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 [ $ 215.50 4 S 862.00
P.O. Box 844 X 1 PART 4 S 10.00 [ S 127.00 | S 32.00 | $ 10.50 | S 10.00 | S 15.00 | S 40.00 | S 20.00 S 12.00 | S 30.00 | $ 306.50 2 S 613.00
West Chicago, IL PART 5 S 13.00 [ $ 600.00 | S 58.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 45.00 | S 215.00 | $ 60.00 S 200.00 [ $ 300.00 | $1,613.00 1 S 1,613.00
60186 PART 6B S 100.00 | S 870.00 (S 211.00|S 260.00|S 45.00 | S 50.00 | $ 250.00 | S 50.00 S 100.00 | $ 350.00 [ $2,286.00 3 S 6,858.00
630.876.0860 PART 6C S 300.00 | $2,200.00 [ S 684.00|S 260.00|S 45.00 | S 50.00 [ $ 500.00 (S 25.00 S 150.00 | $ 400.00 | $4,614.00 1 S 4,614.00
PART 6D S 15.00 [ S 420.00 | S 48.00 | S 43.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 30.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 15.00 S 20.00 | $ 50.00 | § 706.00 1 S 706.00
PART 6E S 15.00 | S 470.00 | S 96.00 | $ 78.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 95.00 | S 20.00 S 30.00 S 60.00 [ § 914.00 1 S 914.00
PART 7 S 78.00 S 76.00 | $ 70.00 S 48.00 | S 90.00 | $ 362.00 1 S 362.00
PART 8 S 800.00 S 800.00 1 S 800.00
ALT #1 S 38.00 S 38.00 500 S 19,000.00 | $ 105,844.00
PART 1 S 350.00|S 630.00 S 140.00|S 140.00|S 70.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 350.00 (S 175.00|$1,500.00 S 750.00|S 75.00 | $1,500.00 S 15.00 | $ 85.00 | $5,850.00 32 S 187,200.00
PART 2A S 18.00 | S 70.00 | $ 18.00 | S 18.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 20.00 S 15.00 | S 20.00 [ § 279.00 6 S 1,674.00
PART 2B S 35.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 18.00 | S 18.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 70.00 | $§ 20.00 S 15.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 296.00 6 S 1,776.00
PART 2C S 280.00 (S 280.00(S 140.00|S 105.00|S 20.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 210.00(S 35.00 No Bid S 70.00 | $1,160.00 4 S 4,640.00
PART 2D S 140.00 | S 280.00 (S 140.00|S 105.00 | S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $ 210.00 | S 20.00 No Bid S 70.00 | § 995.00 4 S 3,980.00
WINTERS PART 2E S 70.00 | $ 560.00 S 140.00(S$S 105.00(S 10.00 | S 20.00 [ $ 210.00(S 20.00 No Bid S 70.00 | $1,205.00 4 S 4,820.00
LANDSCAPE PART 3 S 210.00 | S 280.00 (S 140.00|S 70.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 210.00 | S 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 70.00 | $1,105.00 4 S 4,420.00
50W410 Marcy Rd X NO PART 4 S 420.00 | $2,240.00 | S 140.00|S 280.00 | $ 70.00 [ $ 140.00 S 560.00 (S 140.00 S 35.00 | $ 140.00 | $4,165.00 2 S 8,330.00
Sycamore, IL 60178 PART 5 S 280.00|$1,120.00 | $ 280.00 [ S 280.00 | S 140.00|$ 140.00 |S 700.00 | S 280.00 S 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $3,500.00 1 S 3,500.00
847.72,1.1428 PART 6B S 825.00|51,410.00 (S 270.00|S 360.00 |$ 85.00 | S 85.00 | $ 675.00 | $ 330.00 S 45.00 | S 195.00 | $4,280.00 3 S 12,840.00
PART 6C S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 6D S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 (S 15.00 | S 15.00 | S 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 (S 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 6E S 55.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 475.00 1 S 475.00
PART 7 S 35.00 S 110.00 | S 35.00 S 30.00 S 35.00 | § 245.00 1 S 245.00

PART 8 No Bid S - 1 S -
ALT #1 S 55.00 S 55.00 500 S 27,500.00 | S 234,850.00

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13




LOC#1 LOC #2 LOC #3 LOC #4 LOC #5 LOC #6 LOC #7 LOC #8 LOC #9 LOC #10 LOC#11 LOC #12 LOC #13 LOC #14 LOC #15
SIGN SHERIFF | DEPTOF | HLTH DEPT | CRTSRVCS | GovT ANIMAL |BLDG MGMT| sweripe | HETH DEPT ic - 3RD ST
pip | APD| PARTS e ic & JAIL TRANS | (AURORA) | (AURORA) | CENTER | cONTROL |sHERMaAINT| g&san | (AURORA- | (FESCUE (ZOND KBC CRTHOUSE | SuP-Totals | Occurances WL
VACLOT) | AREA) AREA) Alt.1  Total
PART 1 S 600.00|S 560.00 S 155.00|S 218.00 ]S 70.00 | $§ 75.00 | $ 435.00 (S 90.00 | $1,500.00 [ S 500.00 | $ 150.00 | $1,000.00 S 90.00 [ S 750.00 | $6,193.00 32 S 198,176.00
PART 2A S 50.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 75.00 | $ 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 175.00 [ S 455.00 6 S 2,730.00
PART 2B S 50.00 | $ 25.00 | $§ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 75.00 | § 20.00 S 35.00 | $ 125.00 [ S 405.00 6 S 2,430.00
PART 2C S 140.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 100.00 | $ 120.00 (S 712.00 4 S 2,848.00
CHRISTY WEBBER PART 2D S 140.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 75.00 | $ 120.00 [ S 687.00 4 S 2,748.00
LANDSCAPES PART 2E S 100.00 | S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 12.00 | S 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 25.00 S 100.00 | $ 120.00 [ S 672.00 4 S 2,688.00
2900West PART 3 S 125.00|S 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 35.00 | $§ 12.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 110.00 | S 35.00 S 200.00|S$ 120.00 (S 807.00 4 S 3,228.00
Ferdinand St X 1 PART 4 S 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 50.00 | $ 150.00 | S 35.00 S 100.00 | $ 420.00 [ $1,175.00 2 S 2,350.00
Chicago, IL 60612 PART 5 $1,820.00 | $ 600.00|S$ 225.00 S 250.00|S$ 100.00|$ 115.00 S 900.00 | S 230.00 S 250.00 | $1,800.00 | $6,290.00 1 S 6,290.00
773.533.0477 PART 6B $1,500.00 | $1,000.00 | $ 400.00 | S 350.00 | $ 80.00 | § 150.00 | $1,800.00 [ S 400.00 S 400.00 | $1,500.00 | $7,580.00 3 S 22,740.00
PART 6C $2,500.00 | $2,600.00 | $1,000.00 [ S 350.00 | $ 80.00 | S 50.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 50.00 S 50.00 | $2,600.00 | $9,880.00 1 S 9,880.00
PART 6D S 475.00|S$ 450.00 (S 100.00|S 150.00 | $ 15.00 | S 25.00 | $ 200.00 | S 50.00 S 70.00 | § 500.00 | $2,035.00 1 S 2,035.00
PART 6E S 500.00|S 500.00(S$ 125.00|S 100.00 |S 50.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 50.00 S 50.00 | $ 400.00 | $1,965.00 1 S 1,965.00
PART 7 $1,150.00 S 150.00 | $ 950.00 S 800.00 | $1,500.00 | $4,550.00 1 S 4,550.00
PART 8 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 1 S 1,500.00
ALT #1 S 60.00 S 60.00 500 S 30,000.00 | S 266,158.00
PART 1 S 190.00 | S 490.00 [ S 200.00|S 110.00|S 40.00 | S 45.00 | $ 310.00 | S 90.00 | $1,100.00 [ $ 190.00 | S 80.00 | $1,400.00 S 75.00 | § 60.00 | $4,380.00 32 S 140,160.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5.00|S 5.00 (S 10.00 | $ 10.00 S 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 10.00 | S 10.00 | S 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 10.00 | S 10.00 S 10.00 | S 10.00 [ S 100.00 6 S 600.00
PART 2C S 50.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 40.00 | S 20.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 40.00 | S 10.00 S 30.00 | $§ 25.00 | $ 350.00 4 S 1,400.00
PART 2D S 40.00 | $ 180.00 | S 50.00 | $ 40.00 | S 15.00 | S 25.00 | $§ 15.00 | S 40.00 S 15.00 | S 25.00 | S$ 445.00 4 S 1,780.00
SEBERT LANDSCAPE PART 2E S 20.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20.00 | 20.00 | $§ 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 | $§ 15.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 265.00 4 S 1,060.00
30W741 Butterfiled PART 3 S 100.00 | S 600.00 S 200.00|S 220.00 ]S 45.00 | S 60.00 | $ 400.00 | S 30.00 S 50.00 | $ 90.00 | $1,795.00 4 S 7,180.00
Rd X 1 PART 4 $ 150.00 | S 600.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 50.00 | § 40.00 | S 500.00 | $ 45.00 S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $1,805.00 2 S 3,610.00
Naperville, IL PART 5 S 200.00|S 850.00 S 350.00|S 400.00|$ 20000 (S 250.00|S 650.00 S 175.00 S 150.00 | $ 180.00 | $3,405.00 1 S 3,405.00
630.236.9?:50 PART 6B S 250.00 | $1,300.00 | $ 250.00 [ S 380.00 |$ 100.00|S$ 200.00 S 650.00 S 500.00 S 100.00 [ $ 150.00 | $3,880.00 3 S 11,640.00
PART 6C S 250.00 | $1,300.00 [ S 400.00 | S 380.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 700.00 [ S 350.00 S 80.00 | S 100.00 | $3,800.00 1 S 3,800.00
PART 6D S 100.00 | $ 300.00|S$ 250.00S 100.00|S 70.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 150.00 | S 40.00 S 60.00 | $ 90.00 | $1,240.00 1 S 1,240.00
PART 6E S 50.00 | $ 280.00 | S 50.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 200.00 | S 30.00 S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | § 765.00 1 S 765.00
PART 7 S 400.00 S 65.00 [ $ 300.00 S 100.00 | S 100.00 | S 965.00 1 S 965.00
PART 8 $ 3,500.00 $ 3,500.00 1 S 3,500.00
ALT #1 S 55.00 S 55.00 500 S 27,500.00 | $ 181,705.00
PART 1 S 128.00(S 160.00|S$ 100.00|S 110.00 (S 35.00 (S 55.00 | $ 295.00( S 75.00 [ $ 450.00 (S 400.00 | S 70.00 [ $ 400.00 S 70.00 | $ 145.00 | $2,493.00 32 S 79,776.00
PART 2A S 10.00 | S 45.00 | S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.00 | S 5.00 | $ 100.00 | $§ 5.00 S 5.00 | S 45.00 | S 260.00 6 S 1,560.00
PART 2B S 10.00 | S 75.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5.001|S 500|S$ 195.00 1S 5.00 S 5.00 ]S 30.00 [ § 370.00 6 S 2,220.00
PART 2C S 150.00 | $ 200.00 [ S 150.00 |S 250.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 425.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 310.00 | $1,575.00 4 S 6,300.00
PART 2D S 150.00 (S 200.00 S 150.00|S 175.00 (S 20.00 | $ 4500 | S 120.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 180.00 | $1,065.00 4 S 4,260.00
LOCAL LAWN CARE PART 2E S 150.00 | S 200.00 (S 175.00| S 250.00 | $ 20.00 | $§ 45.00 | S 420.00 | S 25.00 No Bid S 180.00 | $1,465.00 4 S 5,860.00
& LANDSCAPING PART 3 S 175.00 S 200.00 (S 475.00|S 175.00|S 100.00 (S 165.00|S 610.00| S 40.00 S 290.00 | $ 149.00 | $2,379.00 4 S 9,516.00
105112 Schoger Dr X 1 PART 4 S 370.00|S 495.00|S 320.00|S 610.00|S 31000 (S 390.00|S 855.00|S 60.00 S 385.00 [ $ 310.00 | $4,105.00 2 S 8,210.00
Naperville, IL PART 5 S 320.00 (S 400.00|S 200.00(S 320.00]|S 75.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 690.00 | S 75.00 S 195.00 | $ 160.00 | $2,510.00 1 S 2,510.00
60564 PART 6B S 575.00|S 900.00 [ S 410.00|S 495.00 | $ 90.00 | S 145.00 | S 880.00 (S 185.00 S 60.00 | $ 265.00 | $4,005.00 3 S 12,015.00
630.338.5793 PART 6C S 600.00|S 975.00 S 450.00|S 610.00|$ 12500 (S 165.00|51,110.00 | S 195.00 S 85.00 | S 295.00 | $4,610.00 1 S 4,610.00
PART 6D S 75.00 | $ 710.00 | S 75.00 | $ 310.00 | S 40.00 | S 65.00 | S 495.00 [ S 145.00 S 110.00 | $ 65.00 | $2,090.00 1 S 2,090.00
PART 6E S 145.00 S 620.00|S 275.00|S 300.00|S 60.00 | S 90.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 110.00 S 45.00 | S 280.00 | $2,420.00 1 S 2,420.00
PART 7 $1,850.00 S 590.00 | $2,368.00 $1,125.00 | $1,980.00 | $7,913.00 1 S 7,913.00
PART 8 $1,095.00 $1,095.00 1 S 1,095.00
ALT #1 $  75.00 S 75.00 500 $ 37,500.00 | $ 150,355.00

PLEASE NOTE:

- Part 7 only applies to Location #'s 3, 7, 8, 14 15
- Part 8 only applies to Location #13
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